

GROUP I - GRASS SEED						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1860	225 lbs.	lb.	Shade mixed grass seed 40% Creeping Red Fesque 20% Vista or Koket Fesque 20% Shadow Fesque 10% Manhattan II Ryegrass 10% Citation II Ryegrass	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$1.75	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$1.53	#005479
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1861	625 lbs.	lb.	Penncross Bentgrass seed, certified green quality NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$7.40	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$6.78	#001624
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1865	2,025 lbs.	lb.	"A" Mix grass seed, certified 25% Kentucky Bluegrass 10% Merit Bluegrass 20% Pennlawn Fesque 15% Pennfine Ryegrass 15% Nighthawk Ryegrass 15% Manhattan II Ryegrass	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$1.75	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$1.67	1/3 Blue grass 1/3 Fescue 1/3 Rye (All top ten NTEP rating)
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$1.49	Custom Blend minimum 1000# per order 25% Kentucky Bluegrass Shamrock 10% Excursion Bluegrass 20% Brittany Fesque 15% Notable Ryegrass 15% Wayfarer Ryegrass 15% Prototype Ryegrass
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP I - GRASS SEED						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1866	1,250 lbs.	lb.	Manhattan IV Ryegrass Seed NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$1.41	IV is no longer available - bidding Manhattan V
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
27281	10 lbs.	lb.	K-31 Tall Fesque	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$0.85	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$0.78	#001390
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1872	100 lbs.	lb.	Crown Vetch and four (4) times regular amount of inoculant	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$16.33	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$20.75	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1873	2,050 lbs.	lb.	Perennial Rye Grass Seed	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$1.28	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$1.30	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$1.17	#011663 LESCO Double Eagle
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP I - GRASS SEED						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25825	100 lbs	lb.	Tall Meadow Mix (3' and Higher) 25% Purple top grass 10% Camper Little Bluestem grass 15% Butte Side Oats Grama grass 16% Silky Wild Rye grass 10% Tomahawk Indian Grass 5% Niagara Big Bluestem grass 8% Partridge Pea ½% Ox Eye Daisy 5% Black Eyed Susan ½% Marsh Blazing Star ½% Wild Senna 2% Wild Blue Lupine ¼% Wild Bergamot ¼% Appalachian Beard Tongue 1% Smooth Blue Aster ¼% Brown Eye Susan ¼% Early Goldenrod ¼% Ohio Spiderwort ¼% Round Head Lespedeza	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$21.90	10% Tomahawk Indian Grass Indiagrass, PA Ecotype
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25826	100 lbs.	lb.	Short Meadow Mix (3' and Shorter) 8% Deer Tongue grass 14% Camper Little Bluestem grass 6% Butte Side Oats Grama grass 6% Bad River Blue Grama grass 16% Quatro Sheep Fescue 11% Ox Eye Daisy 4% Annual Gaillardia-Indian Blanket 5% Lewis Perennial Blue Flax 8% Wild Blue Lupine 2% Corn Poppy, Red 12% Black Eyed Susan 8% Cosmos	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$27.50	16% Quatro Sheep Fescue
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP I - GRASS SEED						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
				CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$1.38	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$1.39	90% Tall Fesque 10% Bluegrass (All top ten NTEP rating)
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$1.05	#056625 LESCO Trigold Transistion Blend
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	1,000 lbs.	lb.	Tall Fescue Lawn Seed Mixture with Endophyte (only Previous year crop) 29.55% Falcon V Grass 29.55% 2nd Millenium Grass 19.70% Mustang 3 Grass 19.70% Cochise III Grass 00.10% Crop 00.05% Weed 01.35% Inert			

GROUP II - FERTILIZERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
				CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$11.40	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$12.75	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1879	980 bags	bag	6-2-0 Milorganite [South Park order must be delivered in a straight truck] – Min. size bag of 50lbs.			
				CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$12.52	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$13.75	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1880	210 bags	bag	6-2-0 Milorganite, greens grade (min. size bag of 50lbs)			

GROUP II - FERTILIZERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1881	310 bags	bag	Dolomite limestone, pelletized (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$5.90	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$5.25	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$4.50	#008979 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1885	40 bags	50 lb. bag	Isotek-31 (18-2-18) NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$43.83	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
23219	20 bags	50 lb. bag	Isotek -31 (18-3-16) Greens Grade NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$54.46	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1890	75 bags	bag	Mil Chem Starter 18-24-12 (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$25.00	bidding Mil-Chem 12-16-10
				Helena Chemical Company	\$18.50	\$18.25 bag 10-19-10 28% Pscu w/ Root Enhancer
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$18.54	#016420 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP II - FERTILIZERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1891	50 bags	bag	12-4-8 Weed and Feed (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$24.00	15-2-5 w/Viper
				Helena Chemical Company	\$18.99	22-2-4 25% Pscu w/Trimec
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$19.05	#026217 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20451	10 bags	25 lb. bag	20-20-20 Jack's Water soluble fertilizer NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$36.50	ProSol 20-20-20
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	800 bags	25 lb. bag	20-20-20 Plantex Water Soluble NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$36.50	ProSol 20-20-20
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20458	10 bags	bag	Sulphate Pot Ashe, 0-0-50 (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$51.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$49.50	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$41.84	#001586 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP II - FERTILIZERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20459	10 bags	bag	Superphosphate (0-20-0) – (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$39.50	Triple Super Phosphate 0-45-0
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20460	10 bags	bag	Potash (0-0-50) – min. size bag of 50lbs.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$51.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$44.95	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$41.84	#001586 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
26563	360 bags	bag	Winter fertilizer 18-24-12, 50% sulfur coated (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$44.00	bidding 16-25-12
				Helena Chemical Company	\$18.50	18-24-12 30% Pscu
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$20.10	#007814 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
26564	10 bags	bag	Fertilizer 28-6-12, sulfur coated (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$24.00	bidding 22-2-4 (LIMITED SUPPLY)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$18.99	25-5-11 50% Pscu w/Fe
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$19.00	#001935 LESCO 28-5-12 357 PPSCU SOP 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP II - FERTILIZERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
	11 pallets	pallet	Sun Gro Sunshine SB200 – min. size bag of 2.8cu. ft, min. of 48 bags per pallet, NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	10 bags	bag	20-10-20 General purpose fertilizer (min. size bag of 25 lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$31.00	ProSol 20-8-20
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$21.11	#026009 LESCO 19-19-19 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP III – FUNGICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1895	1 case	case	Heritage (min. of 24 lbs./case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$8,820.00	(per 24# case)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$8,398.73	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$367.50	per lb = 8820.00 (24lbs) Agency Price
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP III – FUNGICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1897	4 cases	case	Sea Quenchel (min. of 5 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$192.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$150.00	5 gl Soaker Plus 2 x 2.5 case
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$301.69	Bolster 2 x 2.5 gal/cs #026619
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1898	4 cases	case	Chipco, flowable (min. of 5 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$335.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$450.00	5 gl Chipco 26019, Iprodine
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$340.00	18+ LESCO 2.5 gal/cont. #091088
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1899	4 cases	case	Daconil, flowable (min. of 5 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$386.25	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$225.00	5 gl Echo 720
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$215.00	Manicure 6FL 2 x 2.5 gal/cs #084905
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1900	2 containers	container	Banner Maxx (min. size of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$375.00	(gallon)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$135.00	GI Propiconazole
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$160.00	(gal) Spectator 2 x 1 gal/cs #084910
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP III – FUNGICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1901	4 cases	case	Bayleton (min. of 11lbs./case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$572.00	5.5 lbs
				Helena Chemical Company	\$482.00	5.5 lbs (one case is 5.5 lbs) Bayleton 50 T+O
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$523.82	#086192 5.5 x 4 x 4/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1903	4 containers	container	Curalan EG (min. size container of 2.75lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$93.50	min. order \$1,122.00 (12 x 2.75 lbs)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$1,121.00	DRUM only sold in 33 lbs Drums
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$1,122.00	#091095 Touche Keg 12 x 2.75# Agency Price
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1906	9 containers	container	Subdue Maxx (min. size of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$706.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$588.50	gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$460.00	(gal) 084908Mefenoxam 2 x 1 gal/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20462	2 containers	2.5 gallon container	Zerotol NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$102.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$93.99	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$121.00	#090837 2.5 gal
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP III – FUNGICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1908	2 containers	container	Spotrete Thiram 75 WDG (min. size container of 5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$194.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$188.90	5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$220.00	per cs #090705 2 x 2.5 gal/cs Spotrete F
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20463	25 containers	1 gallon container	Greenshield NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	(discontinued) (can use Zeroto)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$25.85	30 gl Drum Greenshield \$23.19 per gl.
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1909	8 containers	container	Compass by Bayer (min. size of 1lb.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$368.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$376.35	lbs
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$4,586.97	(10#) #081185 10#
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20465	5 cases	case	Cleary 3336F (min. of 4 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$445.00	(substitute Transom 4 x 1 gallon)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$222.50	2.5 gl T-Methyl 2 x 2.5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$819.50	#091515 2 x 2.5 gal/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP III – FUNGICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
23220	2 cases	case	Chipco Signature (min. of 22lbs./case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$599.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$522.50	22 lbs
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$562.73	Prodigy 4 x 5.5#/cs #069099
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20469	6 containers	container	Medallion (min. size container of 8 oz.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$153.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$132.87	8 oz
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$174.59	(8oz) #51691 8oz
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	3 bottles	1 qt. spray bottle	Serenade Fungicide, NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IV – INSECTICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20470	1 case	case	Hot Pepper Wax (min. of 8 lbs./case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$98.50	4 gl. case Hinder 4 x 1gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1910	2 cases	case	Dursban 4-E (min. of 4 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$193.92	4 gl Dursban Pro 2x2 gl = 4gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1912	15 containers	container	Dormant oil aka winter oil (min. size container of 5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$128.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$37.50	5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$52.43	per cs 019560 LESCO Horticultural Oil 2.5 gal x 2/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20473	5 containers	container	M-Pede Insect Soap (min. size container of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$56.00	2.5 Revoke Insect Soap 2 x 2.5
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$63.92	(2.5 gal) #017755 2 x 2.5 gal
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IV – INSECTICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20474	4 bottles	bottle	Enstar II (min. size bottle of 5 oz.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$62.50	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20475	3 containers	container	Azatin-XL (min. size container of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$174.00	QT only comes in quarts Azatrol 4 x 1 gl \$205.00 per gallon
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20476	100 bags	bag	Mach 2 (min. size bag of 50 lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$28.97	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$26.00	#082041 Mach 2 107 0-0-7m 50#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20477	43 bags	bag	Merit Granular (min. size bag of 30lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$37.00	(substitute Zenith)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$37.50	Touchstone G
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$30.00	Bandit #086509 30#/bag
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IV – INSECTICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20478	6 cans	can	Sunspray Oil Ultra-Fine (min. size can of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$128.00	(bidding Pure Spray Dormant Oil) (2 x 2 1/2 gallons)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$43.75	2.5 gl Ultra-Fine
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1917	4 containers	container	Dylox 80 T-O (min. size container of 5lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$142.00	discontinued - bidding Dylox 420SL (2 x 2 1/2 gal)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$50.84	per gal Not made Dylox 420 SL 2 x 2.5
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20481	7 containers	container	PT265 Knox-out Concentrate (min. size of 1 quart)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20482	1 container	container	Botaniguard control on ornamentals or approved equal (min. size of 1 quart)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IV – INSECTICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20483	1 bottle	bottle	Cinnamite (min. size bottle of 21.25 fl. oz.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20484	1 bag	bag	Mesurol-75-w (min. size bag of 2lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$136.20	2 lbs can only be sold in boxes of 8 lbs.
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20485	1 container	container	Floramitel (min. size container of 1 qt.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$217.05	QT
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$455.75	per cs #081243 8 x 8oz/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20487	1 container	container	Duraguard Me (min. size container of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$159.95	GI
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IV – INSECTICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20488	1 container	container	Avid –0.15 EC (min. size container of 1 qt.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$199.50	QT Abamectin
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$835.00	(gal) #15128 1 gal Agency Price
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20489	20 containers	container	Marathon II Granular Translaminar (min. size container of 5lbs.) NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$83.95	per 5 lbs Imide G 1% 4x5 lbs.
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
26569	1 bottle	bottle	Spinosad-based insecticide, OMRI certified or biologically equal (min. size bottle of 1 qt.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$110.00	QT
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	15 cans	10 oz. can	Milky Spore (powder only) NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1919	78 containers	container	Round Up Pro (or equivalent): Must contain surfactant and a minimum Glyphosate content of 41% (min. size container of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$74.00	RANGER PRO
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$92.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$71.25	2.5 gl Gly-Star, Honcho, Gly-Pro
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$70.00	(2.5 gal) Prosecutor Pro 2.5 gal #069289
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
27279	92 containers	2.5 gal container	Round Up Pro Concentrate - Must contain surfactant and a minimum Glyphosate content of 50.2% NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$102.20	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$156.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$116.12	per 1.67 gal container Pro Concentrate has been replaced by Pro Maxx 1.67 Jug
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
27280	18 containers	container	Aquamaster (or equivalent) – Must not contain surfactant. Must contain a minimum Glyphosate content of 53.8% (min. size container of 2.5 gallons).	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$97.50	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$150.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$133.75	2.5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$130.84	(2.5 gal) Aquaneat 2.5 gal #089255
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
26566	1 case	per case	Cidekick2 surfactant (min. of 5 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$48.70	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$160.00	5 gl Cohere 2 x 2.5
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1920	71 containers	container	Surflan (min. size container of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$112.00	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$145.00	(bidding Prozalin)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$147.50	2.5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1921	3 cases	case	Pramitol 25EC (min. of 4 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$135.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$122.20	4 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1924	45 bags	bag	Treflan 5-G (min. size bag of 40lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$21.94	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$33.64	#069282 40#
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1926	4 cans	can	Acclaim Extra (min. size can of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$608.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$517.66	GI Claim Extras
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$638.73	(gal) #032778 1 gal
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
24946	7 containers	1 lb. container	Rodeo NO SUBSTITUTES	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$54.00	gallon No QTs only 2.5 gallons
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
24947	26 containers	2 lb. container	Sahara NO SUBSTITUTES	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$9.50/#	10# Container
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$10.50	per lbs. 4 x 10 lbs case – 10lbs smallest container
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$28.00	Imazuron 2#/cont. #090890
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1927	3 containers	container	Super Trimec (min. size container of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$143.00	BK800 (PBI GORDON)
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$201.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$171.50	2.5
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$145.55	(2.5 gal) Three Way Ester II 2.5 gal/cont. #062551
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1928	2 containers	container	Trimec Plus (min. size container of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$114.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$100.00	2.5
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20497	1 container	container	Sharpshooter (min. size container of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$38.63	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1930	4 cases	2 x 2.5 pallons/case	Millenium Ultra NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$288.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$248.40	\$212.50 Battleship III
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20499	2 cases	case	Drive (min.of 6lbs./case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$514.00	substituting Drive XLR8 (.5 gal x 4)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$420.00	6 lbs. Quinstar 6 x 1lbs case
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$468.97	#063900 1# x 6/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20505	11 containers	container	Pennant Magnum (min. size container of 1 gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$198.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$160.75	GI
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$214.62	(gal) #23183
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20508	10 bags	bag	Snapshot (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$100.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$89.50	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$97.80	#035012 50#
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25830	21 containers	2.5 gallon container	Garlon 4 NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$217.00	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$262.77	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$324.55	#34-00 Garlon 2.5 gal
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	4 containers	2.5 gallon container	Pendemethol NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$810.00	per 15 gallon bidding aquacap - 15 gallon drum
				Helena Chemical Company	\$98.70	Pendulum, Pendency
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25831	5 containers	one gallon	Powerzone NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	\$78.00	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$56.15	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25832	30 bags	bag	Caliber Cote 18-6-12, 4- to 5-month slow release formulation (min. size bag of 50 lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$51.50	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	10 containers	2.5 gallon container	Speed Zone NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$139.98	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$162.30	#084887 2 x 2.5 gal/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	30 bags	31.4 oz. bag	Preen NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	See Treflan
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
26567	1 bottle	1 qt bottle	Bullseye blue dye by Milliken NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$30.00	1 GI Promate blue dye
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	50 bags	bag	Corn gluten (pre-emergent) OMRI certified or bag containing only corn gluten (min. size bag of 50lbs)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
26571	200 bags	bag	Arbor Green Fertilizer 30-10-7 (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$10.00	per gl. Coron 18-2-4 (3-4 gls per 100 gl)
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	14 pints	pint	Ground Zero	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$18.00	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP V - HERBICIDES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
	1 container	container	Dazide – WSG (min. size container of 5 lbs).	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$335.00	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	2 containers	container	Becker Underwood Foam Concentrate (min. size container of ½ gallon)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$30.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$29.50	1 gallon Align Foamer 4 x 1 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$21.90	(gal) Foam Marker -LESCO 4 x 1 gal/cs #025930
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20498	570 cu. yards.	cu. yard	Hardwood Mulch "Double" Shredded. Must be delivered dry, covered and free of all dye and foreign materials.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	\$16.00	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	\$16.00	40 c/y min
20510	1,300 cu. yards.	cu. yard	Topsoil - [30% organic] Must be delivered dry, covered and free of all wood or foreign materials.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	\$16.95	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	\$28.00	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	\$17.00	22 c/y min
26572	550 cu. yards.	cu. yard	Topsoil - [40% organic] Must be delivered dry, covered and free of all wood or foreign materials.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	\$17.95	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	\$28.00	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	\$18.00	22 c/y min
20511	75 cu. yards.	cu. yard	Top dressing [60-20-20] to be delivered as needed	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20513	320 bags	bag	Cypress mulch. Must be delivered dry, covered and free of all dye and foreign materials. (min. size bag of 3 cu. ft).	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	25 bags	bag	Leaf mulch. Must be delivered dry, covered and free of all foreign materials. (min. size bag of 50 lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	10 bales	bale	Compressed Sphagnum peat moss (min. size bale of 3.8 cu. ft.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1932	2 bags	bag	Bonemeal Granular (min. size bag of 50 lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1933	50 bags	bag	Turface MVP (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$9.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$8.01	Turface Allsport 50#/bag #088782
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1935	50 bags	bag	Agricultural lime (min. size bag of 40lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20519	550 cu. yards	cu. yard	Mushroom Manure	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	\$28.00	(minimum 30 cu yds)
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	\$30.00	
1937	50 rolls	roll	Erosion Control Mat (min. size roll of 75" x 300')	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$84.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20520	1 tub	tub	Supersorb C (min. size tub of 6lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20521	1 tub	tub	Supersorb F (min. size tub of 11lb.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20522	6 cans	can	Lesco Wet Concentrate (min. size can of 2.5 gallons)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$346.00	substituting Tricure AD - 5 gallon drum
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$73.56	(2.5 gal) #069383 2.5 gal
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20524	50 bags	2.8 cu. Ft. bags	Redi-Earth or Scotts Seed and plug mix NO SUBTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
20525	6 bags	bag	Extra Coarse Vermiculite (min. size bag of 4 cu. ft.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
20526	75 cu. yards	cu. Yd.	Infield Mix: 3/8" screening and 8 millimeter diameter	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	\$35.50	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1939	75 bags	bag	Silva Fiber Mulch (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1940	2 cases	case	Quelant- CA (min. of 5 liters/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$277.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$58.75	2.5 gl Elemax CA F. 2 x 2.5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
1941	2 cases	case	Macro- Sorb (foliar) – min. of 5 liters/case	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$310.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$35.00	5 lbs. Brexil Multi Micro Spray 8 x 5 lbs
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	6 bags	bag	Perlite (min. size bag of 3 cu. ft.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	15 bales	bale	Long-fibered Sphagnum peat moss (min. size bale of 2.8 cu. ft)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25834	600 cu. yards	cu. yard	Premium Topsoil PH 7.0 to 7.1 3/8" screening and 10 millimeter diameter- Must be delivered dry, covered and free of all wood or foreign materials.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	\$28.00	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VI - SOIL CONDITIONERS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
27282	52 loads	load	Topsoil/Mushroom Manure (50/50 Mixture) – Must be delivered dry, covered and free from of all wood or foreign materials. (min. size load of 22 yds.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	\$704.00	

GROUP VII – HYDROSEEDING PRODUCTS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25898	70 bags	bag	Mulch 76% Paper Fiber Content 20% Wood Fiber Content 3% Poly-fiber 1% Tackifier 12% Moisture content (min. size bag of 50lbs.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$16.00	bidding Jet Spray - 40# bale
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25899	100 lbs.	lb.	Crownvetch	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$18.40	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$20.75	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VII – HYDROSEEDING PRODUCTS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25900	30 packages	package	Innoculent (min. size package of 1.5oz.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$6.25	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
23237	10 cases	case	Limestone flowable (min. of 5 gallons/case)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$73.75	5 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$66.84	#083739 2 x 2.5 gal/cs
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
23238	5 bottles	bottle	Tackifier (min. size bottle of 14 oz.)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
26573	30 bags	bag	Soluble Starter Fertilizer (16-32-15) (Pre-measured for 350 gallon seeder) min. size bag of 25lbs.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$45.00	(bidding 20-20-20 soluble in 20 # plastic pail)
				Helena Chemical Company	\$39.00	per gallon K-Leaf 6-40-16 5 gallon case - mix 1 gallon per 100 gallons
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	\$51.48	16-32-16 Macron #015761 25#/pail
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VIII: GEOTEXTILES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25878	5 rolls	roll	Prefabricated Drainage System (Warrens Terra Flow -100 Prefabricated drainage system or Thickness is 1", color: green, comprehensive approved equal) Core: High density polyethylene material. Strength: 2500 P.S.I. Min. Weight: 4 oz. per sq. yd. Min. Grab Strength: 45 lbs. Min. Puncture Strength, Flow Rate: 170 gal./min. per sq. ft. AD (US Sieve=70-100 6" x 150'.	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25879	5 rolls	roll	Soil Erosion Blankets/netting (Verdyel) (min. size roll of 6.5' x 132')	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	5 rolls	roll	Soil Erosion Blankets/netting (Corlex) min. size roll of 4' x 180'	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25895	5 boxes	box	Soil Erosion Blankets/4" netting staples (min. 500 staples per box)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$50.00	bidding 6# staples – 1,000 per box
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VIII: GEOTEXTILES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25880	5 rolls	roll	Landscape Filter Fabric – 100% Polyester (Warrens Terra Bond or approved equal) Fabric #1112 (min. size roll of 12.5’ x 360’)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25881	5 rolls	roll	Landscape Filter Fabric – 100% Polyester (Warrens Terra Bond or approved equal) Fabric #1114 (min. size roll of 12.5’ x 360’)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25882	5 rolls	roll	Landscape Filter Fabric – 100% Polyester (Warrens Terra Bond or approved equal) Fabric #1120 (min. size roll of 12.5’ x 300’)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25902	6 rolls	roll	Landscape Polypropylene Geo Textile Fabric (Amoco or approved equal) Soil Stabilization (Woven) Fabric #2002 (min. size roll of 17.5’ x 309’)	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VIII: GEOTEXTILES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25903	5 rolls	roll	Landscape Polypropylene Geo Textile Fabric (Amoco or approved equal) Drainage (non-woven) Fabric#4545 (min. size roll of 15'x360')	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25883	5 rolls	roll	Landscape Polypropylene Geo Textile Asphalt Paving Stabilization (one side heat-bonded) Fabric #4597 (min. size roll of 12.5' x 360')	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25884	5 rolls	roll	Typar spun bonded geotextiles (Exxon Chemicals or approved equal) Fabric #3401 (min. size roll of 12.58' x 300')	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
25904	5 rolls	roll	Silt Fence (Frank Roberts or approved equal): min. size roll of 3' x 100'	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP VIII: GEOTEXTILES						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
25885	5 rolls	roll	Soil Anti-Wash/ Geojute (Greenfix or approved equal): min. size roll of 4' x 225'	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IX: MISCELLANEOUS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
	2 containers	1 gallon container	Citric Acid PH Reducer NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	3 cases	case	Cleary Tank Cleaner, 12 one-quart containers per case, NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$144.00	per case - Wipeout 12 x 1 QT
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

GROUP IX: MISCELLANEOUS						
ITEM #	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	REQUESTED UNIT OF MEASURE	DESCRIPTION	BIDDER	UNIT PRICE	NOTES
	1 bottle	per 16 oz. bottle	Dip 'N Grow Rooting Concentrate NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
	4 containers	1 gal. container	Liquid Fence Concentrate NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	No Bid	
				Helena Chemical Company	No Bid	
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	
1938	4 gallons	1 gal. container	Wilt-Pruf Protection Concentrate NO SUBSTITUTE	CWC Chemical Inc.	No Bid	
				Diamond Mulch Inc.	No Bid	
				E.H. Griffith Inc.	\$57.00	
				Helena Chemical Company	\$29.95	Transfilm 4 x 1 gl
				Hough & Hough Farms	No Bid	
				Lesco Inc.	No Bid	
				Wood Waste Recycling, LLC	No Bid	

PERIOD OF CONTRACT: May 2, 2009 – April 30, 2010

NOTES

CWC Chemical, Inc.

- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder has indicated with a check [✓] that their firm is a “Small Business”.

Lesco Inc.

- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.
- Under “Buy American Certificate” the bidder has indicated “NONE”.
- Under “Company Information” the bidder has indicated “N/A – we are a publicly held corporation”.

Helena Chemical Company

- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.
- A corporate seal was not seen on the bid documents. A copy of a seal was submitted.

Hough and Hough Farms

- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder does not agree to make this contract available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.

E.H. Griffith Inc.

- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder agrees to make this contact available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder had indicated with an [X] that their firm is a “Women Business Enterprise”.

Wood Waste Recycling, LLC

- The bidder agrees to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder agrees to make this contact available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder has indicated with a [X] that their firm is a “Small Business”.

Diamond Mulch, Inc.

- The bidder does not agree to make this contract available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities and School Districts within Allegheny County at the prices quoted under this specification.
- The bidder does not agree to make this contact available to all political sub-divisions and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items contained in this bid at the prices quoted under this specification.

<u>Company Name</u>	<u>Address</u>	<u>Contact</u>	<u>Telephone</u>	<u>Fax</u>	<u>Email</u>
CWC Chemical, Inc.	214 Simmons Drive Cloverdale, VA 24077	Larry Sharpe	800-380-9903	540-992-5601	cwcchemica@aol.com
	REMIT TO ADDRESS Same as above	Liz Justice			ljustice@cwchemical.com
Lesco, Inc.	1301 East 9 th Street Suite 1300 Cleveland, OH 44114-1849	Keith McGinty	800-321-5325 x6550	248-581-1433	bids@johndeerlandscapes.com
	REMIT TO ADDRESS 24110 Network Place Chicago, IL 60673-1241				
Helena Chemical Company	566 E. Portersville Road Portersville, PA 16051	Dan Dillman	724-368-3533		
	REMIT TO ADDRESS 4 Kildeer Ct., Suite 100 Swedesboro, NJ 08085	Karen Minix	856-241-2070		minix@helenachemical.com
Hough & Hough Farms	118 Tietze Road Smithton, PA 15479	James H. Hough	724-872-9242	724-872-1017	
	REMIT TO ADDRESS Same as above				
E.H. Griffith Inc.	2250 Palmer Street Pittsburgh, PA 15218	David J. Guerin	412-271-3365 1-800-245-1224	412-271-2614	davidg@ehgriffith.com
	REMIT TO ADDRESS Same as above				
Wood Waste Recycling Inc.	111 Bridge Street Burgettstown, PA 15021	Patrick Borelli	724-947-9445	724-947-9448	woodwaste@verizon.net
	REMIT TO ADDRESS Same as above	Janet			
Diamond Mulch Inc.	# 1 Hershey Road Indianola, PA 15051	Wendy Dunlap	412-963-8003	412-767-9951	Wendyd@diamondmulch.com
	REMIT TO ADDRESS PO Box 432 Mars, PA 16046-0432	Same as above			

Approved By:

Cindy Spence, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

The above tabulation was checked with the original Bid and verified:

FOR CONTROLLER